STHTYTY]
EXTRAORDINARY
Daman 16" April, 2019, 26 Chaitra 1941 (Saka) ;‘l Y,

4
i
%
;

&

"OFFICIAL

Government of India

Y YQl SHUT U9 319 9ama—
' U. T, ADMINISTRATION OF DAMAN & DIU

18 (DT AT T i)
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. LAW/DMN/GDDCCACTS/6-2012/37260
UT Administration of Daman & Diu
Office of the Law Secretary
Department of Law & Justice
Secretariat, Moti Daman.

Dated : 12/04/2019

The Daman and Diu Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2019 (No. 1 or 2019)
published in the Gazette of India Extraordinary Part IT — Section 1 New Delhi dated April 05,

2019 is hereby republished in the Official Gazette of this U.T. Administration of Daman &
Diu,

Sd/-
( Rohit P Yadav )
Law Secretary

¥ K




16 of 1965.

Amendment

of section 22,

Amendment

of section 24.

Amendment

of section 25.

Insertion of
new section
25A.

EXTRAORDINARY No. : 17

DATED : 16™ APRIL, 2019,

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 5" April, 2019/Chaitra 15, 1941 (Saka)

THE DAMAN AND DIU CIVIL COURTS (AMENDMENT)
REGULATION, 2019

No. 1 oF 2019

Promulgated by the President in the Seventieth Year of
the Repubilic of India,

A Regulation further to amend the Goa, Daman and Diu
Civil Courts Act, 1965 as in force in the Union territory of
Daman and Diu,

In exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of
article 240 of the Constitution, the President s pleased to
promulgate the following Regulation made by him : —

1. (1) This Regulation may be called the Daman and Diu
Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2019.

(2) 1t shall come into force at once.

2. In the Goa, Daman and Diu Civil Courts Act, 1965
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 20,
in sub-section (4), for the words “one lakh rupees”, the
words “five fakh rupees” shall be substituted.

Short title and
commencement

Amendment of
section 20,

3. In the proviso to section 22 of the principal Act, for the words “one

lakh rupees”, the words “ten lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

4. In section 24 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in the proviso. —

() for the words “three thousand rupees”, the words “twelve

thousand rupees” shall be substituted :

(%) for the words “one thousand five hundred rupees”, the words “six

thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

5. In section 25 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), in the proviso, for
the words “one lakh rupees”, the words “ten lakh rupees” shall be

substituted.

6. After section 25 of the principal Act, the following shall be inserted,

namely : -

Contd, /---

Page 2 of 3




EXTRAORDINARY No. : 17
DATED : 16™ APRIL, 2019,

Trar;sfer qf “25A. On the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil Courts
pending suits  (Amendment) Regulation, 2019, —
and appeals

(1) all suits in which the amount or value of the subject matter
does not exceed five lakhs rupees and which are pending before the
court of Civil Judge (Senior Division), immediately before such
commencement, shall stand transferred to the concerned court of Civil
Judge (Junior Division) and such court may deal with such suit from
the stage which was reached before such transfer or from any earlier
stage or de novo as such court may deem fit;

(2) all appeals in which the amount or value of the subject matter
does not exceed ten lakhs rupees and pending before the High Court
immediately before such commencement, shall stand transferred to the
concerned District Court and such District Court may deal with such
appeal from the stage which was reached before such transfer or from
any earlier stage or de novo as such court may deem fit :

Provided that nothing in this section shall apply to suits and
appeals which are pending before the court of Civil Judge (Senior
Division) or as the case may be, before the High Court, which are
statutorily provided under the relevant enactment before such court”.

Sd/-
RAM NATH KOVIND.
President

Sd/-
DR. G. NARAYANA RAIU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.

Government Printing Press, Daman - 04/2019 ~ 15,
[ Price Rs, 02.00 ]

Page 3 of 3




